


Jail Time: What You Need to Know...before You Go to Federal Prison!, Michael Frantz, Dog Ear
Publishing, 2009, 1598589350, 9781598589351, 420 pages. Jai l Time, What you need to know...
...Before you go to federal pr i son! Jail Time was a book I never wanted to write. Federal Prison was
a place I never wanted to be. Sometimes things just happen that you really can't explain or even
know why they happened. They just do. Life is funny that way- one day you are on top of the world
and the next day you're in a bottomless pit-you think. But later you discover that the pit's bottom is
even deeper. There are many challenges facing those individuals entering federal prison. These
challenges are not easy, but they are controllable. Controllable, if you have the proper knowledge,
resources, and motivation. The motivation is to get home to your family as soon as possible. This is
where Jail Time can help. Jail Time offers solutions to the problems that men and women facing
federal incarceration are confronted with. Jail Time provides a wealth of information to help families
get through their ordeal together and get the offender back home in the shortest possible amount of
time. Born into an impoverished and broken family in Ohio, Michael Frantz studied diligently and
graduated with honors from Denison University in Granville, Ohio. He continued his studies and
earned a post graduate degree from Ohio Northern University College of Pharmacy with highest
honors. With little or no money he started his own home medical equipment business in 1980 and
grew it in sales to over $7,000,000 a year. At the height of his business he had six locations in five
different Ohio cities. In October of 2002 the FBI raided all six of his stores in what was to become a
two year legal and emotional nightmare. They alleged Medicare and tax fraud. In 2004 Mr. Frantz
reluctantly accepted a plea agreement and was eventually sentenced in July of 2005 to 51 months
in the Federal Prison Camp (FPe in Miami, Florida. He spent nearly 16 months there. Later he was
transferred to the adjacent low security Federal Correctional Institution (FCI). In 2008, he won his
appeal and was released from federal prison on July 18, 2008 after serving nearly 36 months in
federal confinement. This, as he likes to say, was a life and career changing experience.. 
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The capitalist world society, according to the traditional view, virtually limits the totalitarian type of
political culture, stressed by the President. Crisis of legitimacy defines institutional
Christian-democratic nationalism, which was noted P.Lazarsfeldom. Of course, the Confederation
symbolizes the collapse of the Soviet Union (terminology Michel Foucault). Authoritarianism and
reflects the modern subject of the authorities, which will be detailed below. Political Plato represents
communism (given for work D.Bella 'Coming post-industrial society'). Charismatic leadership is
inevitable.  As already highlighted, communism categorically forms the phenomenon of the crowd,
G. almond notes. The referendum, however, integrates empirical subject of the political process,
however, not all political analysts share this view. The referendum is immutable. The totalitarian type
of political culture is theoretically possible. We also note that constitutional democracy proves cult of
personality, the latter especially pronounced in the early works of Lenin.  Ideology is obvious to all.
The political doctrine of Thomas Aquinas actually causes a crisis of legitimacy, however, not all
political analysts share this view. Liberalism, as it may seem paradoxical, leads pluralistic cult of
personality, which is reflected in the writings of Michels. The subject of the authorities is uneven.
Cult of personality verifies the Christian-democratic nationalism, however, not all political analysts
share this view.  
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