
Yuri Monogatari, Volume 2, Various, AniLesboCon (ALC) Publishing, 2004, 0975916009,
9780975916001, 140 pages. Seven stories from artists and writers around the world that deal with
all aspects of lesbian relationships. From science fiction and realistic looks at long-term relationships
to humorous fantasies and poetic angst, Yuri Monogatari has something for everyone who has ever
been in love.. 
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Nancy Drew #5: The Fake Heir , Stefan Petrucha, Apr 18, 2006, Juvenile Fiction, 96 pages. Nancy,
Bess, and George try to find the true heir of a fortune they found locked inside a safe on an old
yacht..

12 Days , June Kim, Oct 26, 2006, Comics & Graphic Novels, 191 pages. "12 Days" asks, "how long
does it take to get over losing the love of one's life?".

The Kite Runner , Khaled Hosseini, 2011, Afghanistan, 132 pages. 1970s Afghanistan:
Twelve-year-old Amir is desperate to win the local kite-fighting tournament and his loyal friend
Hassan promises to help him. But neither of the boys can ....

Thriving on Vague Objectives A Dilbert Collection, Scott Adams, Nov 1, 2005, Humor, 128 pages. A
collection of the widely read comic strip captures the reality of the nine-to-five worker--from the
techno-man stuck in a dead-end job to the trash collector who knows ....

Yuri Monogatari , Erica Friedman, Mar 28, 2007, Comics & Graphic Novels, 176 pages. Yuri
Monogatari ("Lily Tales") is an annual collection of lesbian-themed Japanese-style comic stories
(yuri manga). These tales about lesbian life and love come from artists ....

Fushigi YÐ“Â»gi: Summoner , Yuu Watase, Feb 22, 2002, , 200 pages. When best friends Miaka
and Yui open an ancient Chinese book, they find themselves transported to a parallel world where
Miaka is identified as a priestess who must save an ....

Nancy Drew #11: Monkey-Wrench Blues , Stefan Petrucha, Sarah Kinney, Nov 13, 2007, Juvenile
Fiction, 112 pages. When Hinkley builds a prototype for a new high-efficiency car, he asks Nancy
and her mechanic Bess to drive it in a government-sponsored race in which the winner receives a
....

Yuri Monogatari 5 , ALC Publishing, Nov 14, 2007, , 221 pages. Collection of manga style comics
about lesbians..

Angel, Volume 1 , Erica Sakurazawa, Jul 8, 2003, Comics & Graphic Novels, 232 pages. Follows an
angel with a fondness for gin and lime as she heals the people she meets, including a lonely
convenience store clerk, a little girl with a negligent mother and ....

http://bit.ly/1aSfuw0


Scryed, Volume 4 , YÐ•ÐŒsuke Kuroda, Yasunari Toda, Sep 16, 2003, , 200 pages. Their world
torn asunder, Kazuma and Akira march towards the city consumed with vengeance. They've set
their sights on Martin Zigmar, the corrupt leader of HOLY. However ....

Azumanga Daioh , Kiyohiko Azuma, Sep 30, 2003, Comics & Graphic Novels, 160 pages.
Chronicles the adventures of a quirky group of girls and three of their teachers at a high school
where the class genius is ten years old, English class may suddenly become ....

Works , Eriko Tadano, Jul 18, 2006, , 96 pages. Four sexy stories of lesbian life and love by
Japanese yuri manga artist Eriko Tadeno. From stories of high school crushes and adults coming
out to an office May-December ....

Agnes Quill An Anthology of Mystery, Dave Roman, Jason Ho, Oct 18, 2006, Comic books, strips,
etc, 130 pages. Follows the adventures of teenage detective Agnes Quill, who lives in a haunted
city, has a natural ability to communicate with the dead, and helps souls find their way in the ....

The Last Uniform 1 , Mera Hakamada, Oct 1, 2008, , 160 pages. When two people adore each
other, they're nothing less than devoted... even when they happen to be the same gender. Each girl
at the Tsubakigaoka Girls' Dorm is paired with a ....

The Dreaming, Volume 1 , Queenie Chan, Dec 13, 2005, , 192 pages. Identical twins Jeanie and
Amber arrive at their new boarding school on the edge of the Australian bush to find it steeped in
mystery..

The surrogates , Robert Venditti, Brett Weldele, 2006, Comics & Graphic Novels, 158 pages. The
year is 2054, and life has been reduced to a data feed. The fusing of virtual reality and cybernetics
has ushered in the era of the surrogate, a new technology that lets ....

Yuri Monogatari ("Lily Tales") is an annual collection of lesbian-themed Japanese-style comic stories
(yuri manga). These tales about lesbian life and love come from artists and writers from around the
world, including popular Japanese yuri manga artists Akiko Morishima and Rica Takashima and
four-time contributors Althea Keaton, Beth Malone and Kristina Kolhi.

This was printed by a small publishing company, an anthology "by women for women." They are
meant to be adult yuri stories, a change in pace from most other yuri manga, and because all stories
were created by different artists they each have their different styles. You may not like a couple
stories, but you're bound to like some of them. If you want more mature yuri, not like the standard
commercial manga, be sure to add this to your collection

Yuri Monogatari Volume 3 features original stories by artists and writers from Japan, America and
Europe. Filled with stories of irresolvable love to wild fantasy, comedy, real-life adventures and
harsh, but sensual realism, Yuri Monogatari includes expressions of lesbian life and love in a way
that everyone can enjoy.

As I mentioned in my reviews for Yuri Monogatari volumes 4 and 5, this anthology was put together
with stories created by various artists, so each yuri story is different from the other. It makes for a
maturer read than most commercial yuri, so you should check this out for a change in pace (if you
read my other reviews, yes I am repeating myself here. I'm delivering the same message, because
none of these volumes deserve to have just one single star). You'll dislike some stories, but they are
so varied that you'll still like a couple. My personal favorite story is 'Overboard,' where two girls from
foreign countries do not understand each other's language but intimately understand each other
nonetheless; it's really cute and sweet. If you're starting out with the series, start with this volume,
and if you like it, the next two volumes shouldn't be any different.
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