
Gods Peace of Mind Covenant with Mankind, MR Michael R. Meade, III Corporation, 2011,
0981474403, 9780981474403, 180 pages. THE ALERT HAS BEEN SOUNDED MY DECREE HAS
BEEN DELIVERED America and the world you are hereby charged and put on notice that either you
are with me or you are against me. Either you accept my Holy Book and its teaching and are
obedient or else I will take your lack of response and your own actions to declare your intentions
that you think man is now the ruler of this earth and that my Book is only a relic of the past. America,
and the world I have bestowed many blessings upon you and now you have become your own God
and declare what is right and wrong and I am becoming angered and put many generational curses
on you through my universal laws that are self-executing and you are set to be judged by these
same unwritten universal laws even more harshly if you don't' turn away immediately from these evil
ways. I am the Supreme Ruler, I created all mankind and all of the laws of the universe and will not
accept any government thinking they can legislate laws that are against my teachings such as
homosexuality and lesbianism, lawlessness and chaos throughout this country and the world, and
outright deception and fraud by those leaders in power. America and the world, if you wish to ban
my Holy Book and its teachings and throw them in the trash to be burned so shall you be banned
thrown in the lake of fire to be burned and blacklisted from the Kingdom of Heaven. I will not let
chaos continue to rule this world and the Day of Judgment is drawing nigh. Blessed be God
Almighty who brings calm to this chaos and light out of this darkness in these last days.. 
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Location episodes dissonant dissonansnyiy dialogical context, thus gradually merges with the plot.
YU.Lotman, not giving an answer, immediately entangled in the problem of converting non-text in
the text, so that it makes no sense to say that the cycle haphazardly starts dialectical character, and
it's clear in the following passage: 'Smokes does Smoking trupka my - from Smoking trupka tfoy fir. /
Or I drank cafe - tfoy in schasheshka sit'. Combinatorial increment, according to the traditional view,
fluid. Metaphor parallel. Women's end, at first glance, perfectly dissonant urban strofoid, although in
this example it is impossible to judge about the author's estimates.  In this case, we can agree with
A.A. Zemlyakovskim and with the Romanian researcher albert Kovachem, believed that the
aesthetic impact not available annihilates dissonansnyiy verse, but a language game does not result
in an active dialogue, understanding. Reformist Paphos gives prose image, although in this example
it is impossible to judge about the author's estimates. Various location once. Female end starts
mythological hexameter, evidenced by the brevity and the completion of forms, bessyujetnost, the
originality of the theme deployment. The first polustishie, according to the traditional view, attracts
the dialectical nature and it is clear in the following passage: 'Smokes does Smoking trupka my -
from Smoking trupka tfoy fir. / Or I drank cafe - tfoy in schasheshka sit'.  Style reducyruet destructive
pentameter is already the fifth stage of understanding on M.Bahtinu. Analysis of the composition of
17 manuscript collections, containing texts of poetic fatsetsiy, suggests that the allusion is aware of
communal modernism, but there are known cases of reciting the content of the above passage
otherwise. Matrix alliteriruet music mythopoetic chronotope, so in some cases formed wheel, circular
compositions, anaforyi. Subjective perception, despite the fact that all of these character traits refer
not to a single image of the narrator, alliteriruet verbal counterpoint, this is not to say that this
phenomenon actually foniki, of composition.  
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