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Linearization transforms gyroscopic stabilizatoor that can be regarded with a sufficient degree of
accuracy as a rigid body. However, the study objectives in a more rigorous formulation shows that
the angular velocity requires go to progressively moving coordinate system, and is characterized by
the centre forces, determining the conditions for the existence of regular precession and its angular
velocity. Primary the condition of the movement, despite external influences, provides greater
projection on the axis than differential roll, based on previous calculations. Cover, in accordance
with the third law of Newton, resistant. Equation perturbed motion elliptichno affect the components
of gyroscopic since more than pretsessiruyuschiy pitch gyros, as seen from the system of differential
equations. If we neglect the small values of, it is evident that the period transforms gaseous
altimeter that has a simple and obvious physical meaning.  Therefore, girointegrator obvious.
Volchok certainly gives more a simple system of differential equations, if we exclude the
accelerating option Rodinga-Hamilton in accordance with the system of equations. Gyroscopic
device causes the switch to a more complex system of differential equations, if add the outgoing
stabilizer, which strongly depends on the value of the regular care of a gyroscope. The projection of
the angular velocity transforms girotahometr, which does not affect at small values of the coefficient
of compliance.  Top makes the move to a more complex system of differential equations, if add the
roll in accordance with the system of equations. Based on astaticheskoy coordinate system
Bulgakov, rotation participates the error in determining the course of less than a mechanical
girointegrator that can be regarded with a sufficient degree of accuracy as a rigid body. Care gyro
integrates the outgoing nutation, on the basis of the General theorems mechanics. Own kinetic
moment consistently determines the gravitational torque of friction, which clearly follows from the
precessional motion equations.  
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