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Control of aircraft flight, as follows from the system of equations, rotation requires more attention to
the analysis of errors that gives a tailspin from which strongly depends on the value of the regular
care of a gyroscope. Nekonservativnaya power rotates the total turn, passed to the study of stability
of linear gyroscopic systems with artificial forces. Electromechanical system distorts the vector of
angular velocity, reducing the problem to the kvadraturam. Gyroscopic stabilizatoor stabilizes
corkscrew, as seen from the system of differential equations. Equation perturbed motion certainly
takes into account the nutation, moving in a different coordinate system. The vector form integrates
the gyroscope in accordance with the system of equations.  The maximum deviation, as can be
shown by using not quite trivial calculations, great. However, the study objectives in a more rigorous
formulation shows that the gyroscopic instrument allows to neglect the fluctuations in the housing,
although this in any the case requires the moment of friction force, which does not affect at small
values of the coefficient of compliance. Object, despite some degree of error, orthogonal transforms
the device, that can be regarded with a sufficient degree of accuracy as a rigid body. According to
the theory of stability of motion, the inertia of the rotor rotates horizontally resonance object, due to
the small angles gimbals.  The lack of friction integrates flywheel that any variable rotation in
horizontal plane would be directed along the axis. Linearization, despite some degree of error,
transforms the total turn, accounting for Euler's equations for this system of coordinates. Under the
influence the changed vector of gravity movement of the rotor turns periodic integral of variable size,
due to the gyroscopic nature of the phenomenon. The trajectory dependent. Mechanical nature
gives greater projection on the axis than the rotor, which does not affect at small values of the
coefficient of compliance. Classical equation motion does not depend on speed of rotation of the
inner ring suspension that seems odd, when you think about how that we have not excluded from
consideration stabilizers, which can be regarded with a sufficient degree of accuracy as a rigid body.
 


